
Dear Requestor, 
 
Thank you for your Freedom of Information Request. 
 
The Council has responded to the questions asked under the Freedom of Information Act. FOI is 
used to request information that is held/recorded by Local Authorities about their activities; we have 
not responded to the survey which asks for opinions. 
 
The Council is unable to provide information for the questions you have asked, however Public 
Health England have done some research into some of the differences in the impact COVID-19 that 
has been seen between different groups of people. Please see attached the Local Resilience Forum’s 
recent section on BAME/covid-19 which you may find useful. 
 
With regards to the additional questions asked, please see below: 
 
1. What percentage of people diagnosed with Covid19 in your borough or service are from the BAME 
Community? The Council does not hold this information. 
 
2. What percentage of people in your borough or service are from the BAME Community working in 
these professions? The Council does not hold this information. 
 
3. JSNAs (Please write full name) provide the means by which local leaders work together to 
understand and agree on the needs of all local people, with the joint health and wellbeing strategy 
setting the priorities for collective action. 
 
What is the average spend per service user by JSNA in your borough or service if a provider? The 
Council does not hold this information. 
 
4. What is the total number of BAME confirmed Covid19 deaths at your Local Authority or service? 
At present death certificates in the UK do not include ethnicity. This means that, unfortunately, the 
Authority cannot include ethnicity in the analysis of deaths for COVID-19 or any other cause. 
 
5. What is the total number of BAME confirmed Covid19 Births at your Local Authority or service? 
The births data that Nottinghamshire County Council receives from NHS Digital does not at present 
include ethnicity of mother or child, and the legal birth registration process does not record 
ethnicity. 
 
I hope this now satisfies your request, and should you have any further enquiries please do not 
hesitate to contact me directly on the details below. 
 
In addition to this and for future reference Nottinghamshire County Council regularly publishes 
previous FOI’,s and answers on its website, under Disclosure logs. (see link) 
http://site.nottinghamshire.gov.uk/thecouncil/democracy/freedom-of-information/disclosure-log/ 
 
You can use the search facility using keywords. 
 
If you wish to raise any concerns about the way your request was dealt with, then please write to 
the Team Manager, Complaints and Information, County Hall, West Bridgford, Nottingham, NG2 7QP 
or e-mail foi@nottscc.gov.uk quoting the reference number above. 
 
Kind Regards 
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Complaints, Information & Mediation Officer. 
Complaints and Information Team 
Chief Executive’s Dept 
Nottinghamshire County Council 
County Hall, West Bridgford, Nottingham, NG2 7QP 
 


