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Request for Information: Ref NCC-035312-18
Assaults on Teachers

Thank you for your request for information assaults on teachers. | can now let you have the
following information in response to the questions you raised.

1. How many teachers have been assaulted on school premises or just outside school
premises in the last three years?

Incidents of Physical Violence — All School Staff

2015 143
2016 — 181
2017 — 235
2018 — 288

Please note that the Nottinghamshire County Council accident/incident recording system does
not require reports to be by job role so the figures above relate to all school staff incidents not
just teachers.

2. How many teachers have been assaulted by a parent with a child at their school in the
last three years? This information is not held.

3. How much money has been paid out in compensation for teachers who have been
assaulted? £0

4. How many teachers have been sexual harassed or assaulted on school grounds?
Please specify harassment or assault. This information is not held.

5. How much compensation has been granted to teachers who were sexually harassed or
assaulted on school grounds? £0

Please provide answers in a yearly break down for the last four years (2015, 2016, 2017,
2018 to date) and provide the level of education eg. primary teacher, secondary school
teacher, or sixth form teacher. If possible please provide the name of the school where a
teacher was assaulted.

We hope this now satisfies your request, and should you have any further enquiries please do
not hesitate to contact me directly using the contact details below. In addition and for future
reference Nottinghamshire County Council regularly publish previous Freedom of Information
Requests and answers on our website, under Disclosure logs, available at the following link:

http://site.nottinghamshire.gov.uk/thecouncil/democracy/freedom-of-information/disclosure-log/

Complaints & Information Team, Nottinghamshire County Council, County Hall, Loughborough
Rd, West Bridgford, Nottingham, NG2 7QP



If you are unhappy with the service you have received in relation to your request and wish to
make a complaint or request a review of our decision, you should write to the Team Manager,
Complaints and Information Team, County Hall, West Bridgford, Nottingham, NG2 7QP or email
complaints@nottscc.gov.uk.

Yours sincerely

Name Jilly Walden
Position Complaints information and Mediation Officer
Nottinghamshire County Council

Complaints & Information Team, Nottinghamshire County Council, County Hall, Loughborough
Rd, West Bridgford, Nottingham, NG2 7QP



