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Request for Information: Ref NCC-036093-18

Thank you for your request for information. | can now let you have the following information in
response to the questions you raised.
Libraries

1. Please list the libraries that were owned by the council in 2010/11, if possible including
their addresses and postcodes

If the council does not hold information for 2010/11 please provide the requested
information for the earliest year for which information is held.

2. Please list the libraries that are owned by the council in 2018/19, if possible including
their addresses and postcodes

3. Where a facility listed in response to question 1 is not listed in response to question 2,
please specify any that were subjected to community transfer

Q1 and Q2 can be answered by visiting https://www.inspireculture.org.uk/reading-
information/find-a-library/ as the answer is the same.

Youth centres

4. Please list the youth centres that were owned by the council in 2010/11, if possible
including their addresses and postcodes

If the council does not hold information for 2010/11 please provide the requested
information for the earliest year for which information is held.

Please see attached spreadsheet

5. Please list the youth centres that are owned by the council in 2018/19, if possible
including their addresses and postcodes Please see attached spreadsheet
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6. Where a facility listed in response to question 4 is not listed in response to question 5,
please specify any that were subjected to community transfer Please see attached
spreadsheet

Community centres

7. Please list the community centres that were owned by the council in 2010/11, if
possible including their addresses and postcodes

If the council does not hold information for 2010/11 please provide the requested
information for the earliest year for which information is held.

8. Please list the community centres that are owned by the council in 2018/19, if possible
including their addresses and postcodes

9. Where a facility listed in response to question 7 is not listed in response to question 8,
please specify any that were subjected to community transfer.

Nottinghamshire County Council have never owned any community centres.

Children's centres

Please note that this section is based on the funding of centres, including but not limited
to centres that were/are owned by the council.

10. Please list the children's centres/Sure Start centres that were funded by the council in
2010/11, if possible including their addresses and postcodes. See list attached. We had 58
CCs to start with, and continue to have 58 CCs, since much of the service is delivered through
outreach, rather than from specific buildings. Not all CCs have ever had a building, delivering on
a community based outreach approach. We have had minimal changes since 2010, as in the
main we have converted buildings to early year’s education and childcare, rather than give them
up altogether, however Carlton CC building was declared surplus, along with Rosebrook
bungalow - part of Ladybrook CC, but main Ladybrook site remains, and a second building at
Stapleford CC was also declared surplus.

If the council does not hold information for 2010/11 please provide the requested
information for the earliest year for which information is held.

11. Please list the children's centres/Sure Start that are funded by the council in 2018/19,
if possible including their addresses and postcodes. List attached. The list shows our hubs,
satellites and those CCs where the building is mainly used for early year’s education and
childcare

12. Where a facility listed in response to question 10 is not listed in response to question
None subjected to community transfer, but several are now being used to deliver the expanded
funded childcare offer for 2, 3 and 4 year olds, with close links with the other CC Services are in
place, to ensure families continue to have access to the range of services they need.

11, please specify any that were subjected to community transfer-see above

Subsidised bus routes

13. Please list the bus routes that were subsidised by the council in 2010/11, including the
operator of each route; the operator and route number will suffice

If the council does not hold information for 2010/11 please provide the requested
information for the earliest year for which information is held.
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Please see attached spreadsheet

14. Please list the bus routes that are subsidised by the council in 2018/19, including the
operator of each route; the operator and route number will suffice.

Please see attached spreadsheet

We hope this now satisfies your request, and should you have any further enquiries please do
not hesitate to contact me directly using the contact details below. In addition and for future
reference Nottinghamshire County Council regularly publish previous Freedom of Information
Requests and answers on our website, under Disclosure logs, available at the following link:

http://site.nottinghamshire.gov.uk/thecouncil/democracy/freedom-of-information/disclosure-log/

If you are unhappy with the service you have received in relation to your request and wish to
make a complaint or request a review of our decision, you should write to the Team Manager,
Complaints and Information Team, County Hall, West Bridgford, Nottingham, NG2 7QP or email
complaints@nottscc.gov.uk.

Yours sincerely

Name Jilly Walden
Position Complaints information and Mediation Officer
Nottinghamshire County Council
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