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Request for Information: Ref NCC-032216-18
Highway inspection records Gamston 

Thank you for your request for information relating to Highway Inspection records Gamston, 
Nottingham, NG2 6NN. I can now let you have the following information in response to the 
questions you raised.

The Lock Public House, Gamston, is situated on Radcliffe Road and attached is the Street 
History report for this street section.

This report covers inspections (conditional survey), customer enquiries (customer service), 
works orders and repairs (maintenance management) and road opening/closing notices (street 
works).

You will see from this that the report was actually run to 30/01/2018 so as to include the first 
post incident inspection which was carried out on 29/01/2018 when 'no actionable defects' were 
identified. This inspection was a carriageway safety inspection as the carriageway on this street 
is inspected monthly whereas the footway is inspected annually (last inspection 05/09/17). Any 
defects such as a missing manhole lids are likely to have been identified, as part of this if 
present in the main walkway. The next post incident footway inspection is not programmed till 
September 2018. There have been no enquiries or reports raised relating to a missing cover 
since (and indeed prior to) the incident and therefore no ADHOC F/W inspections have been 
undertaken. The only notice that has been received regarding this incident was this FOI, 5 
months since the alleged accident. There is no Street Works section contained in the report as 
there have been no road opening/closing notices registered for this street section.

We hope this now satisfies your request, and should you have any further enquiries please do 
not hesitate to contact me directly using the contact details below. In addition and for future 
reference Nottinghamshire County Council regularly publish previous Freedom of Information 
Requests and answers on our website, under Disclosure logs, available at the following link: 

 http://site.nottinghamshire.gov.uk/thecouncil/democracy/freedom-of-information/disclosure-log/ 

If you are unhappy with the service you have received in relation to your request and wish to 
make a complaint or request a review of our decision, you should write to the Team Manager, 
Complaints and Information Team, County Hall, West Bridgford, Nottingham, NG2 7QP or email 
complaints@nottscc.gov.uk.
Yours sincerely

Name Jilly Walden
Position Complaints information and Mediation Officer 
Nottinghamshire County Council
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