
 

Older People's Care Survey 2017 – Freedom of Information Request 

 

 

 

1. Average and maximum prices 

 

(i) Please provide the average and maximum prices of LA-funded places and the average prices of 

self-funded places for older people. If you do not have exact figures for this group, please 

provide your closest approximations based on your available data, such as your market 

position statements. E.g. “between £650 and £700 a week” or “approx. £675”.  

 LA-funded Self-funded 

Average prices Maximum prices Average prices 

Care home (£/week) 

NCC fee rates below 
Not known 

Care home with 
dementia support 
(£/week) 

Nursing home (£/week) 
(after FNC)* 

Nursing home with 
dementia support 
(£/week) (after FNC)* 

Extra care housing 
(£/week) 

Home care (£/hour) £15.56 

* Please take into account reimbursements paid to settings through FNC (see glossary), to reflect 

the actual price charged per individual place. (I.e. the difference between the total amount received by a 

setting and reimbursements they may receive through FNC.)  

 

Care home 

banding 

Residential 

care 

Residential Care 

Included DQM 

Payment** 

*Nursing care 

(rates below 

exclude FNC at 

£155.05 

 *Nursing Care 

including  DQM 

Payment**(rates 

below exclude FNC at 

£155.05) 

Band 1 £441 £453 £479 £489 

Band 2 £489 £539 £549 £591 

Band 3 £519 £567 £578 £621 

Band 4 £532 £579 £589 £633 

Band 5 £548 £596 £606 £649 

 

**DQM Payment – enhanced payment for care homes meeting standards on dementia care (34 homes in 

Nottinghamshire) 
 

 

2. Number of individuals using services 

 

(i) Please provide the number of older people using the following different services over a year. 

Please use your closest approximations, if exact figures are unavailable. 

 

Provided below the number of individuals (older adults) using these services at any time during the year 

01/04/16 – 31/03/17.   



 Number of individuals (LA-
funded) 

Number of individuals (self-

funded) 

Care home 2227 

Unable to answer 

Care home with dementia support 457 

Nursing home 1159 

Nursing home with dementia 

support  
254 

Extra care housing  67 

Home care 2244 

 

 

(ii) Please provide the number of hours per year used by all older people using home care 

services in total per year. Please use your closest approximations, if exact figures are 

unavailable. 

 LA-funded Self-funded 

Home care (hours per year) 1,047,200 Unable to answer 

 

3. Source of funding 

 

(i) What proportion of older people in receipt of social care in your area are entirely LA-funded, 

partly LA-funded, or entirely self-funded? This includes all kinds of social care referenced in our 

glossary at the beginning of the survey. Please use your closest approximations, if exact 

figures are unavailable. 

 

 

Entirely LA-funded Partly LA-funded Entirely self-funded 

Unable to answer % Unable to answer % Unable to answer % 

 

(ii) What proportion of the places for older people in residential care (i.e. care homes and nursing 

homes) that you commission are funded using top-ups from third parties (to any extent)? Please 

use your closest approximations, if exact figures are unavailable. 

Proportion of places paid for with 
top-ups from third parties  

Unable to 
answer 

 

4. Sufficiency of Services 

 

(i) Based on your latest market analysis, is there sufficient provision in your area to meet the care 

needs of older people for the following services? Please indicate with a cross (X). 

 Yes No Don’t Know 

Care home X   

Care home with 
dementia support  

In some areas  In some areas  

Nursing home  X  

Nursing home with 
dementia support  

 X  



Extra care housing  X  

Home care  X  

 

When did you most recently assess sufficiency? 

 

This is ongoing – for homecare capacity reports are produced weekly. 

 

(ii) If you indicated ‘No’ or ‘Don’t Know’ for any answers, please use the space below to tell us 

about the issues in your area. We are grateful for any additional information.  

 

Recruitment of nursing staff is a local and national issue as is sufficient homecare capacity. We are 
currently redesigning our model of homecare and will be re-procuring shortly.  We have an Extra Care 
strategy to deliver more Extra care facilities. 

 

 

5. Out of area placements 

 

(i) Do you use out of area placements for older people’s care? Please indicate with a cross (X).  

Yes No Data not held/accessible 

X   

 

(ii) If so, what proportion of your total placements for older people’s care are out of area? Please 

use your closest approximations if exact figures are unavailable, or leave blank if the 

data is not held or not accessible. 

 

Proportion of provision sourced from 

outside your local authority area 

As at 31/03/17 246 older adults service users out of 

2326 were placed in an out of county placement.  This 

includes people in a home in the City boundary. 

 

 

6. Future projections 

 

(i) Do you expect (i) the demand, and (ii) the supply of social care to increase, decrease or stay the 

same over the next year? Please indicate with a cross (X). 

 

 Increase Decrease Stay the same Don’t know 

Demand x    

Supply    x 

 

 

Thank you for completing this survey. 

 


